
A procedure that uses a 
catheter device to place a 
new aortic valve in your 
heart.

The TAVR procedure is 
performed collaboratively with 
an Interventional Cardiologist 
and a Heart Surgeon.

The Advanced Practitioner 
(APP) will be assisting in your 
care during the hospital stay. 
Typically, you will meet with 
our APP within a week after 
your hospital discharge for a 
follow up visit.

The TAVR Coordinators will 
help coordinate all of the 
testing and work-up required 
for the replacement of your 
new heart valve. They will be 
updating you and your family 
regularly on the plan of care 
and will also be a consistent 
resource for answering your 
questions.

Allina MHI Structural Heart & 
Valve Program at United 
Hospital

Phone - 651-241-2730
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James Kolbeck, MD 
Interventional 
Cardiologist

Nishtha Sodhi, MD 
Interventional 
Cardiologist

Natasha Lee, PA 
Physician Assistant 

Brian Mahoney, MD 
Interventional 
Cardiologist

Robert Steffen, MD 
Heart Surgeon 

Sarah Potts, NP     
Nurse Practitioner

Bilal Murad, MD 
Interventional 
Cardiologist

Natarah Broich, PA 
Physician Assistant 

Caitlin Rau, PA   
Physician Assistant 

Gabriel Olivares, MD 
Heart Surgeon

Bryan Laufenberg, PA 
Physician Assistant

Margaret Mary 
Underwood, PA 
Physician Assistant 
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Carrie Hiemstra, 
BSN, RN             
TAVR Coordinator

Jessica Timmerman, 
BAN, RN                 
TAVR Coordinator

Danielle Mitchell          
Scheduling Coordinator 
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